
ROYAL DIVER






ROYAL
DIVER
Inspired by the
Vintage Skin Diver
watches from 1950',
the Royal Diver is an
homage to these
timeless timepieces
that are still in use for
diving.



UNIDIRECTIONAL
ROTATING BEZEL
The rotating bezel is a key
functionality in diver watches. Its
60-minute graduations allow a
diver to accurately and safely
monitor diving time and
decompression stops.



DOUBLE LAYER
DIAL
The double layer dial has the
purpose of increasing the
visibility under water or dark
areas. 



STAINLESS STEEL
Comfortable and sport chic
design, the lightweight case is
made out of 54g of stainless
steel.



FLUORINE
RUBBER BAND
The tropical fluorine rubber 
 band (for both colors), is
waterproof and breathable. the
design is also inspired from the
first divers watches using rubber
band.



CALIBER STP 1-11
Swiss made automatic winding
movement with a diameter of
25,60mm, the caliber STP 1-11
offers a power reserve of 44
hours. 26 jewels and a 28,800
vibrations per hours (4 Hz), it
features hours, minutes, sweep
seconds, date, and a date rapid
corretor. 



WEARING THE
WATCH FOR THE

FIRST TIME
Before being worn for the first
time, or if it has stopped, the
watch must be wound manually
in order to function correctly and
precisely. 
To wind the watch manually,
unscrew the winding crown
completely, then turn it several
times clockwise. (Turning in the
other direction has no effect.) A
minimum of 25 turns is required
for adequate partial winding. The
watch will then be wound
automatically as long as it is
worn on the wrist. 
Carefully screw the crown back
down against the case to ensure
waterproofness.



SETTING THE
ROYAL DIVER

To set the time, unscrew the
crown and pull it out completely
(2nd notch). The seconds hand
is stopped, allowing you to set
the time to the precise second.
To set the hour and minute, turn
the crown in the anticlockwise
direction.
It's important to make sure, when
adjusting the time, that you are
in the day or night (close to the
date passage). It's strongly
recommended to pass the date
first, by rotating the hands, then
adjust properly the time.



SETTING THE
ROYAL DIVER

To set the date (once the time is
adjusted), push back the crown 1
notch back (second is ticking
back), then rotate the crown
clockwise to quick set the date.
However: it is very important
to never adjust the date
between 9pm and 3am. As the
date gears are rotating, the
finger that pushes the date disc
will brake if the rapid correction
is made between this time range.

Once the adjustments done,
push back the crown. Then
carefully screw the crown back
down against the case to ensure
waterproofness.



USE OF THE
UNIDIRECTIONAL
ROTATING BEZEL

TO CHECK THE ELAPSED TIME
Before the dive 
Align the zero mark “ ▼ ” of the
rotating bezel with the position of
the minute hand.
During the dive
Read the scale of the rotating
bezel, to which the minute hand
points so as to figure out the
elapsed time.



USE OF THE
UNIDIRECTIONAL
ROTATING BEZEL

TO CHECK THE REMAINING
TIME
Set the “ ▼ ” mark to the
scheduled time.
This way, you can now see the
amount of time that remains until
the scheduled point.

Note: The rotating bezel of
divers' watches conforming to
the ISO standard can only be
rotated counterclockwise in order
to reduce the risk of error.



CARING YOUR
ROYAL DIVER

You can help preserve its lustre
by cleaning it occasionally with a
microfibre cloth. You can also
wash the case and bracelet from
time to time using soapy water
and a soft brush. After wearing
your watch in the sea, it is
important to rinse it with fresh
water to remove any salt and
sand deposits.

Important:
Before cleaning your watch,
always ensure that the crown is
screwed down properly against
the case to guarantee
waterproofness.



WARRANTY
COVERAGE

After the date of purchase, your
Royal Diver is covered by a 3
year Service Guarantee. This
guarantee excludes any damage
or deterioration that results from
an accident or from mishandling
of the watch. Any intervention by
a non-AvedisGabriel-authorised
third party or the addition of any
non-AvedisGabriel-manufactured
parts or accessories will void the
Service Guarantee.



AFTER SALE
SERVICE

AvedisGabriel watch servicing
ensures that your timepiece will
continue to perform optimally
and meet our brand requirements
in terms of precision, reliability
and waterproofness throughout
its life.
To guarantee continued accuracy
and water resistance,
AvedisGabriel recommend you to
periodically return your watch to
an Official AvedisGabriel
Retailer or Service Centre for
professional servicing. 
During a complete service, the
watch is dismantled and all of its
components (the case, bracelet
and movement) are closely
examined. 



AFTER SALE
SERVICE

The movement is entirely
disassembled and all the parts
are carefully inspected. 
All worn parts replaced, then
lubricated and reassembly. 
Your watch undergoes a series
of tests to verify its functions,
waterproofness and power
reserve, as well as the precision
of its movement. 



AFTER SALE
SERVICE

WARRANTY
COVERAGE

After the complete service, your
Royal Diver is covered by a 2
year Service Guarantee. This
guarantee excludes any damage
or deterioration that results from
an accident or from mishandling
of the watch. Any intervention by
a non-AvedisGabriel-authorised
third party or the addition of any
non-AvedisGabriel-manufactured
parts or accessories will void the
Service Guarantee.




